
 
 

CITY OF ALEXANDRIA 
FIRST HALF 

2022 REAL ESTATE TAX,  
REFUSE FEE AND 

 STORMWATER UTILITY FEE 
 ARE DUE JUNE 15, 2022 

 
The City of Alexandria has mailed bills for the first half 2022 real 
estate tax, refuse fee, and stormwater utility fee to all property 
owners and/or mortgage companies.  The calendar year 2022 
real estate tax rate is $1.11 per $100 of assessed value.  
Payment must be received by June 15, 2022, to avoid late 
payment penalty and interest. 
 
Payments can be made online at alexandriava.gov/Payments or 
mailed to: City of Alexandria, P.O. Box 34750, Alexandria, VA 
22334-0750. 
 
In-person payments are also accepted 24 hours a day at the City 
Hall drop box on the Royal Street side of the building or in the 
Treasury Division, Room 1510, Monday-Friday, 8AM-5PM.  
Payments must be in the drop box by midnight on June 15, 2022, 
to be considered on time. 
    
General real estate tax information is available on the City’s 
website at alexandriava.gov/RealEstateTax.   Detailed 
assessment, tax balance, and payment information is available at 
realestate.alexandriava.gov. 
 
For payment questions or to request a tax bill, please call the 
Treasury Division at 703.746.4800, or email 
payments@alexandriava.gov. For assessment questions or to 
change a mailing address, please email 
realestate@alexandriava.gov.  For questions on refuse fees or 
stormwater utility fees, please call Alex311 at 703.746.4311 or 
submit questions online at alexandriava.gov/Alex311. 
 


